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at 2:30 PM 
 

 

 For Admission 

1.  Petition No. 
61/2024 

 
(Rays Power 
Experts Ltd.) 

Petition seeking directions/order(s) 
against the Respondent for release of 
outstanding amounts with respect to 
power supplied by the petitioner from 
23 Rooftop Solar Power Plants 
Aggregate capacity of 1.134 MW for 
the period commencing from 
commercial operation date of the 
plants arising out of Power Purchase 
Agreements entered between the 
parties filed by Rays Power Experts vs. 
NDMC 

2.  Petition No. 
62/2024 

 
TPDDL 

Petition for seeking in-principle 
approval of the Bidding Documents for 
procurement of 200MW of power from 
Hydro Power Station(s) through 
competitive bidding process for 
meeting Renewable Purchase 
Obligation 

3.  Petition NO. 
64/2024 

 
TPDDL 

Petition seeking approval of the 
Commission of a Scheme 
Replacement of non 5 star rated AC 
and fans with BEE 5 star rated Air 
Conditioner and fans 

4.  Review 
Petition No. 

66/2024 
 

(BRPL) 

Petition seeking review of Order dated 
20.12.2024 in Petition No. 55/2024 
seeking approval to levy differential 
power purchase cost adjustment 
charges (PPAC) incurred during July to 
September, 2024 filed by BRPL 

5.  Review 
Petition No. 

67/2024 
 

(BRPL) 

Petition seeking review of Order dated 
20.12.2024 in Petition No. 56/2024 
seeking approval to levy differential 
power purchase cost adjustment 
charges (PPAC) incurred during July to 
September, 2024 filed by BYPL 

6.  IA No. 01/2025 
In  

Petition No. 02 
of 2025 
(NDMC) 

Application of waiver of processing fee. 

7.  Petition No. 
03/2025 

 
IPGCL 

Petition under Section 86(1(f) of the 
Electricity Act, 2003, seeking direction 
for payment of fixed costs by 
Respondents (NDMC and MES) for 
allocation of power from Rajghat 
Power House for the period from June, 
2015 to December 2015 along with 
carrying cost. 

  

 


